
2024 SUBSCRIPTION PLANS

BRONZE
$300/MO

GOLD
$1100/MO

Access to up to one 15-minute
phone conference per week for 
no additional charge between 

the hours of 4 p.m. to 7 p.m. PT.

Access to up to one 15-minute
phone conference per week for 
no additional charge between 

the hours of 4 p.m. to 7 p.m. PT.

Access to up to one 15-minute
phone conference per week for 
no additional charge between 

the hours of 4 p.m. to 7 p.m. PT.

Access to up to four 30-minute
phone or videoconferences per 
month for a discounted flat
fee of $250 each between the
hours of 4 p.m. to 7 p.m. PT.

Unlimited Access to Email 
Responses at discounted

flat fee of $125 each
(responses will not exceed a
single paragraph in length).

Access to up to two 30-minute
phone or videoconferences per 
month for a discounted flat fee 

of $250 each between the hours 
of 4 p.m. to 7 p.m. PT.

Unlimited Access to Email 
Responses at discounted flat fee
of $125 each (responses limited to

a single paragraph in length).

Access to up to One Review +
Redline (no revisions) of a Contract

Not to Exceed 10 pages in length for
a discounted fixed fee of $700 

Access to unlimited other 
attorney services at 2024 Flat Fee 

Rates

Access to up to One Review
(no redlines or revisions) of a 

Contract Not to Exceed 5 
Pages in length for a 

discounted fixed fee of $400

Access to unlimited other 
attorney services at 2024 Flat 

Rates

Unlimited Access to Email 
Responses at discounted flat fee 
of $125 each (responses limited 
to a single paragraph in length).

Access to up to One Review + 
Redline (no revisions) of a 

Contract Not to Exceed 5 pages 
in length for a discounted fixed 

fee of $550

Access to unlimited attorney
services at 2024 Flat fee Rates

SILVER
$600/MO


